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1 1st violin: answers may note that it plays the theme itself at the beginning but thereafter plays 
only accompanying figures in Variations I, II and III before restating it in Variation IV.  The nature 
of the texture in each variation should be made clear e.g. 2-part in Variation I, the 1st violin 
providing a busy descant to the 2nd violin's theme. 

 
Cello: there is much to point out here in terms of both its harmonic role and its expressive 
sonorities.  All answers should note how its scale leading to the repeat of the final phrase of the 
theme in Variation II is taken up by both viola and 1st violin in their subsequent variations. 

 
 
2 The Notes for Guidance draw attention to the position of this symphony as a very late example of 

an earlier classical model.  Thus teachers have been alerted to the need to consider the issue of 
'typicality'.  They are very likely to have compared it with Mozart's Symphony no 40 in G minor 
(parallels between the two are frequently drawn) but answers are not expected to address the 
question by means of comparison with this or any other specific symphony. 

 
 All answers should be clear about the genre and basic structure:  
 

• that the movement consists of  a Menuet and a Trio, both in triple metre 

• that the Menuet is in two 'halves', each of which repeats 

• that the Trio is in two 'halves', each of which repeats 

• that the Menuet is then played again without repeats. 
 

Most will probably indicate the relatively 'lighter weight' of the Trio, in terms of length, harmonic 
complexity, dynamics, texture and mode.  More informed answers may note that, in spite of being 
softer, the Trio remains fairly fully-scored. 
 
Comments on tonality may be limited to the observation that the Menuet is in the relative minor of 
the main key of the symphony (i.e. G minor) and that the Trio is major (G major) but many 
candidates should also be aware of the typical binary feature of the Menuet – its modulation at 
the end of the first half to its relative major (B flat i.e. the tonic of the symphony) – and the lack of 
such a modulation in the Trio. Candidates who know the music very well may also comment on 
the sequential passage in the second half of the Menuet, or the bagpipe drone/pedal of the cello 
at the beginning of the Trio. There are many other striking details to which reference may be 
made e.g. the strong unison opening (not subsequently revisited), the near-development to which 
this theme is subjected, or the wide dynamic range of the Menuet. 
 
Credit will be given for discussion of relevant features of the orchestration. 
 
Although the question asks for 'typical' features, credit should also be given for examples of what 
is untypical or for details which show particularly close familiarity with the music.  
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3 Basic points to be made include: 
 

• three movements: quick-slow-quick (no Menuet and Trio as in the Schubert Symphony) 

• outer movements in the same key, middle one usually in a related key (more informed 
candidates may know that Beethoven is more adventurous in this respect) 

• recognisable Sonata Form characteristics of 1st movements 

• cadenzas 

• 3rd movements usually rondos. 
 

Some answers may choose to expand the structural discussion e.g. to tease out the Sonata Form 
features of the 1st movements more closely but this is not a requirement.  Other well-developed 
answers may choose instead to focus more on the relationship between soloist and orchestra, 
perhaps showing how this differs from movement to movement and composer to composer, e.g. 
the typically more lyrical role in Mozart's slow movement. Comparisons are not essential, 
however: the question only asks candidates to refer to examples drawn from the two concertos. 

 
Middle band answers should address the element of display and show an understanding of some 
typical figurations e.g. the difference between a scale and a broken chord.  More informed 
answers may also be able to describe Alberti and other accompanimental patterns, or 
ornamentation, particularly the use of the long trill as a signalling device. 

 
 
4 The linking device in Mussorgsky's Pictures is obvious i.e. the 'Promenade', and all candidates 

should be able to identify and explain how at least one or two of the versions effect the transition 
from one picture to the next.  Simple statements about tempo or instrumentation are, on their 
own, valuable as evidence of familiarity with the music but, to be fully creditworthy, they need to 
go on to explain how the mood of the last picture is reflected or the subject matter of the next 
anticipated. 

 
The choice of 'contrast' is most likely to be Schumann's Carnaval or Elgar's Enigma Variations.  
The latter is particularly amenable to demonstration as a 'coherent whole': here the focus might 
be less on the 'characters' of the individual pieces and more on explaining variation techniques.  
The coherence of Schumann's Carnaval will be more elusive to candidates working without 
scores – the recognition of the presence of ciphers may, in any case, be a red herring.  Answers 
which deal with this set may inevitably turn into detailed programme notes identifying the 
personalities and their significance for Schumann and explaining how he depicts them.  
 
The question asks for 'any other set': the other two Core Works may be eligible as contrasting 
sets, but only if the answer deals with them in their entirety i.e. the candidate will need to have 
studied the other two Vivaldi concertos or the rest of Holst's Planets Suite. 

 
 
5 The question invites candidates to compare the two Vivaldi concertos they have studied with 

Ravel's version of Pictures at an Exhibition and/or Holst's two Planets pieces.  To access the 
highest mark bands answers should express a view and attempt to support it by evaluating the 
effectiveness of the examples offered for discussion: these should include at least one from 
outside the Core Works.  Middle-band answers are likely to express a view and to compare 
different approaches but perhaps without making wholly-successful links between technique and 
effectiveness.  The case can, of course, be argued both ways.  Implicit in the distinction between 
'large' and 'small' is the matter of range of instrumental colour.  Answers are likely to deal with 
this obliquely rather than head on.  Appreciation of relevant detail should be fully rewarded.   
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6 This issue is flagged in the Notes for Guidance.  Answers need not be limited to discussion of the 
Core Works, nor need they refer to them at all. Accounts of music outside the Core Repertoire 
must explain the link with the original stimulus clearly before going on to comment on other 
occasions for its use.  The degree of success in answering will probably depend upon the scope 
and variety of the 'range of examples'. 

 
 
7 Again, specificity is crucial to accessing the higher bands.  Most answers will probably offer a 

ready list of favourite melodies (which need not be limited to the Prescribed Repertoire or, 
indeed, to Western music at all) but discussion of relevant aspects of such features as pitch, 
rhythm, phrasing shape/direction, articulation or word-setting is needed. 

 
 
8 Candidates offering a Composing option in the Syllabus are more likely to choose this question: 

the last part of it offers them an opportunity to reflect on their own learning processes.  The most 
obvious distinction – between formal and informal methods – will probably occur to most 
candidates but this must be backed up by reference to two specific examples: Beethoven's brief 
period of study with Haydn is likely to be familiar to many, though different conclusions can be 
drawn. 

 
 
9 There are two parts to this question, both of which must be attended to for the answer to access 

the highest bands: i) a clear account of the way(s) in which at least one tradition is distinctive; ii) 
an awareness of its practitioners' responses to other musical influences.  The discussion of the 
latter is directed principally at the impact of contemporary influences, most likely Western popular 
(or classical) music, but some answers may also show an awareness of historic interchange 
between cultures.  Most answers will probably show an awareness of the role of 'fusion' in world 
music today but discussion of this should be supported by careful reference to specific examples 
in which the diverse strands are teased out 

 
 
10 Answers will probably focus principally on concert life in 18th-century.  Vienna which will have 

been studied as background to the Prescribed Works in Section A.  An awareness of both formal 
and informal occasions should be shown as well as some understanding of how music was 
disseminated after first performances, e.g. hand-copied scores, arrangements for piano.  
Similarly, the best answers should distinguish, broadly, 'public' and 'private' ways of listening 
today. 
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